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Pass it on... 
 
Please forward this ebulletin to your 
friends, family and colleagues. 
 
Healthwatch Hammersmith & Fulham 
is the health and social care 
champion for local residents. 
 
Join now and get involved! 
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 Patient Experience Survey 
 
Healthwatch Hammersmith and Fulham gives you 
the chance to say what you think about how local 
health and social care services are run.  
 
Your experiences are important and can help to 
inform the commissioners and service providers.  
 
Whether it is a compliment, concern or complaint, it 
is easy to tell us about your experience by 
completing our survey, available now on the 
website.    More 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
                Tell us about your experience of services 
 
 
 Insight and Reports 
 
Thanks to your feedback, we are able to produce a 
detailed report every three months, outlining the 
general experience of local services including GPs, 
Dentists, Hospitals and Social Care. The reports 
measure satisfaction over time and examine what 
works well, and what could be improved. 
 
In addition, we have produced in-depth reports on 
the experience of Pharmacies and Dentists, with 
important findings highlighted and recommendations 
made. 
 
All reports are shared with service commissioners 
and providers – this helps to ensure that local health 
and social care services best meet local needs. 
 
Find out more on the website.    More 

 Volunteer Opportunities 
 
Healthwatch Hammersmith & Fulham is always on 
the lookout for volunteers, especially from the local 
community. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
                    We work to improve local services 

 
A range of opportunities is currently available, 
including Engagement Volunteers, who collect 
feedback about local services, and Administrative 
Volunteers, who assist with general office based 
duties. 
 
Volunteering is fun and rewarding – meet new 
people, learn new skills, and help us to improve 
services at the same time. You can volunteer as 
much or as little as you want. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Who can volunteer? 
To volunteer with us, you must either reside within 
Hammersmith & Fulham or be a service user of 
health and social care within the borough and over 
the age of 16 years. 
 
We believe that everyone is unique and has 
something valuable to contribute, from sharing life 
experiences, skills and knowledge, to untapped 
talent and the willingness to make a real difference 
to society. You do not need any qualifications to 
volunteer with us. Just a willingness to listen, an 
open mind and a desire to raise the voice of local 
people. 
 
To find out more about volunteering, contact the 
office or visit the website.    More 
 
 

   

 

 

 

 

   “ The nurses kept us well 
      informed. ” 
 

Join us today and have your say! 
 

 

   

 

   

 

 

 

 

   “ My vaccine was fast  
      and efficient. ” 
 

Join us today and have your say! 
 

 

   

 

   

 

 

 

https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSfQGIFlk0UpD6KXPz5F4s6_e601TZaVGuA5Qgl_Ih7QTN2xkw/viewform
https://healthwatchhf.co.uk/what-we-do/our-reports/
https://healthwatchhf.co.uk/get-involved/volunteering/


 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  Aged 30 or Over? Get Your Covid-19 Vaccine! 
 
Hammersmith & Fulham residents aged 30 or over (or 
at high risk from Coronavirus) can now get a Covid 
vaccination jab without needing an invitation from 
their GP. Eligible frontline health workers and social 
care workers of any age can also receive the vaccine. 
 
There are now several ways to arrange your vaccine. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
                       Book online, call 119 or walk in 

 
You can book your vaccination appointment online.  
 
You can call 119, free of charge (7am to 11pm, seven 
days a week) to book your appointment. 
 
Or, if you are eligible, you can walk in to the Novotel 
hotel NHS mass vaccination centre in central 
Hammersmith – no appointment is needed. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

The walk-in services are open 9am-7pm. If you walk-
in, you will need to bring proof of age, your name 
and address and your NHS number (if you don’t have 
your NHS number you can still walk-in). You cannot 
walk-in to get your 2nd dose vaccination – these must 
be booked via the NHS in advance. 
 
Walk-in services are dependent on availability and it 
is possible you will be asked to return at a later date 
if supplies run out on a particular day. So you may 
prefer to book to guarantee a vaccine slot. 
 
You can also book your appointment to receive the 
jab at smaller vaccination clinics held in White City 
and Hammersmith Grove.    More 
 
 
 

   

 

 

Features 

 

 

  Covid-19 Vaccine - Benefits Outweigh Risks 
  
The UK vaccination programme has been very 
successful with more than 30 million people 
vaccinated and more than 6,000 lives already saved. 
 
Recently there have been reports of a rare condition 
involving blood clots and unusual bleeding after 
vaccination. This is being carefully reviewed but the 
risk factors for this condition are not yet clear. 
 
Although this condition remains extremely rare there 
appears to be a higher risk in people shortly after the 
first dose of the AstraZeneca (AZ) vaccine. Around 4 
people develop this condition for every million doses 
of AZ vaccine doses given. 
 
This is seen slightly more often in younger people 
and tends to occur between 4 days and 2 weeks 
following vaccination. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
         More than 30 million people have been vaccinated 

 
This condition can also occur naturally, and clotting 
problems are a common complication of Covid-19 
infection.  
 
An increased risk has not yet been seen after other 
vaccines but is being carefully monitored. 
 
In those aged 18-29, an alternative vaccine will be 
offered when the time is right for vaccinating this 
group, and GPs will ensure the appropriate vaccine is 
offered, and any questions are answered.   
 
The Department of Health website contains answers 
to frequently asked questions.    More 
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  “ As a deaf person I often 
     feel dismissed.” 
 

Join us today and have your say! 
 

 

   

 

   

 

 

 

 

  “ Staff have a great sense 
     of humour. ” 
 

Join us today and have your say! 
 

 

   

 

   

 

 

 

https://www.lbhf.gov.uk/articles/news/2021/05/aged-30-or-over-get-your-covid-vaccine-jab-today
https://healthmedia.blog.gov.uk/2021/03/12/covid19vaccines-faqs/


 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Features 

 

 

 'Speak CAMHS' Crisis Helpline 
 
'Speak CAMHS', a new specialist helpline, is available 
for anyone to discuss mental health concerns they 
have about children and young people, under 18, 
living in Ealing, Hounslow and Hammersmith & 
Fulham. The name was chosen by young people. 
 
The helpline is run by Child and Adolescent Mental 
Health Services (CAMHS) professionals from West 
London NHS Trust, who are familiar with local 
services and have a range of specialist mental 
health knowledge. 
 
The helpline is available to anyone, this includes 
children and young people, their families, carers, 
CAMHS colleagues, and other professionals, such as 
GPs, social workers and teachers. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
                     Addressing mental health concerns 

 
The helpline aims to support children and young 
people to utilise their safety plan, which they may 
have formulated with their community or other 
specialist care teams, in order to minimise any 
potential risk issues. 
 
The purpose of the helpline is to avoid and de-
escalate periods of crisis for children and young 
people, reducing visits to emergency departments 
and avoiding admissions to psychiatric hospital. 
 
To contact Speak CAMHS, call 0800 328 4444 and 
choose Option 2. The helpline is open Monday to 
Friday from 8am to 11pm. Weekends and Bank 
holidays from midday to 8pm.    More 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 Introducing YoungMinds 
 
YoungMinds are the UK’s leading charity supporting 
children and young people's mental health.  
 
It takes courage to ask for help. But for many young 
people who do, the support they need just isn’t 
there. To help address this they have developed 
three ‘programmes’: 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
               Ensuring young people are ‘never alone’ 

 
Never Alone 
They will provide young people with reassurance and 
advice to help them make positive choices for their 
mental health and know what to do next if they are 
struggling. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Someone to Turn To 
Whenever a young person opens up about their 
mental health to an adult they trust, they should be 
able to find someone who really ‘gets it’ and can 
respond positively. 
 
Powerful Young Voices 
A youth-led movement will help to make sure support 
is targeted, and there for anyone who needs it.  
 
Alex, Youth Panel Member says "I'm proud that 
YoungMinds genuinely uses the voice of young people 
to guide their approach as a charity and change the 
misconceptions around mental health."   
 
Find out more on the website.    More 
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   “ My surgery has been 
      cancelled, again. ” 
 

Join us today and have your say! 
 

 

   

 

   

 

 

 

 

  “ The receptionists do a 
     difficult job. ” 
 

Join us today and have your say! 
 

 

   

 

   

 

 

 

https://www.westlondon.nhs.uk/news/latest-news/introducing-speak-camhs
https://youngminds.org.uk/


 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Features 

 

 

 Bowel Cancer Awareness 
 
A message from our colleagues at Bowel Cancer UK: 
 
“Every 15 minutes somebody is diagnosed with 
bowel cancer in the UK. It can affect anybody, 
regardless of their age or background. It's treatable 
and curable especially if diagnosed early, and nearly 
everyone survives if diagnosed at the earliest stage.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
               Too many people are unaware of the signs 

 
However this drops significantly as the disease 
develops. More than 16,000 people die from bowel 
cancer in the UK every year. 
 
Our new survey results show that too many people 
remain unaware of the signs they could have bowel 
cancer. 
 
They show that around half of adults living in the UK 
(42%) are not aware of any symptoms of bowel 
cancer, despite it being the UK's second biggest 
cancer killer. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Covid-19 has sadly had a huge impact on bowel 
cancer services, which were already stretched 
before the crisis.  
 
The number of people referred, diagnosed and 
treated for the disease has gone down significantly 
because of the pandemic and this devastating effect 
is likely to take months or even years to recover.  
 
We're all in this together, we hear you, we're 
listening and we will provide help and support for 
you at every step of the way.”    More 
 
 

 Maternity Champions 
 
The Maternity Champions offer support to parents-to-
be and new parents before and after birth. 
 
It is run in Old Oak and the neighbouring areas. They 
aim to make sure that residents know about local 
antenatal and postnatal services and feel happy to 
come to them with ideas for new services they might 
like to see. 
 
Maternity Champions are trained volunteers who are 
able to help new parents from pregnancy and into 
the first year of the child’s life. 
 
They work closely with midwives, health visitors and 
Children’s Centre workers to increase the uptake of 
ante and postnatal services, guide and support new 
parents and encourage parents to form social groups 
and to support each other. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
            Support from pregnancy and into the first year 

 
Maternity Champion volunteer Tess Coen received an 
Outstanding Contribution award at the Community 
Champions Annual Conference. Contributing an 
incredible 200 hours of volunteer time over a one 
year period. 
 
Tess said "I love working with and helping mothers 
and babies. It is the most rewarding experience”. 
 
If you live on Old Oak Estate or in the surrounding 
neighbourhood you can join up as a Maternity 
Champion volunteer.    
 
Find out more on the website.    More 
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 “ That 0845 number costs 
    money! ” 
 

Join us today and have your say! 
 

 

 

   

 

   

 

 

 

 

  “ A single point of access 
     would be helpful. ” 
 

Join us today and have your say! 
 

 

 

   

 

   

 

 

 

https://www.bowelcanceruk.org.uk/support-us/bowel-cancer-awareness-month/?gclid=EAIaIQobChMIlsfutoSS8AIVUoFQBh030gldEAAYASAAEgLEhPD_BwE
https://www.peabody.org.uk/neighbourhoods/old-oak-centre/volunteering/maternity-champions#:%7E:text=Maternity%20Champions%20are%20trained%20volunteers%20who%20are%20able,form%20social%20groups%20and%20to%20support%20each%20other


 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 Celebrating a Year of ‘Keeping Well’ 
 
The 1st of June marks one year since the Keeping 
Well staff support service for North West London 
launched during the Covid-19 pandemic. 

The Keeping Well service was one of the first staff 
resilience hubs to be set up in England as an 
immediate response to the pandemic. 
 
They provide psychological support for staff working 
in the NHS, social care, ambulance service, 
volunteers and any other staff providing care to 
others in the community in the North West London 
area (this covers Brent, Ealing, Hammersmith & 
Fulham, Harrow, Hillingdon, Hounslow, Kensington 
& Chelsea and Westminster boroughs). 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
                   Looking out for the welfare of staff 

 
Over the past year the service has helped support 
over 1,000 individuals with their wellbeing, the 
pandemic has been very challenging especially for 
those working in health and social care.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
You can live chat with a wellbeing professional on 
the Keeping Well website. 
 
There are also a number of different resources and 
self-help materials available via the resources 
section.    More 
 
Stay informed with all Keeping Well updates by 
following on Twitter, Instagram and Facebook 
(search '@KeepingWellNWL'). 

 

Spotlight 

 

 

 ‘Compassionate Communities’ Funding 
 
Imperial College Healthcare NHS Trust and Imperial 
Health Charity have announced that 20 community 
organisations will receive up to £30,000 in funding 
to improve the health and wellbeing of people most 
affected by Covid-19 in North West London. 
 
Imperial Health Charity has committed £360,000 for 
the joint ‘Compassionate Communities’ initiative to 
help local organisations address some of the barriers 
that prevent the most vulnerable members of the 
community access health care.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
               Helping people to access local services 

 
The chosen projects all work with people who 
experience health inequality and some of the 
complex, longer-term impacts of Covid-19. The 
projects will also receive advice and support to help 
them maximise the impact of their work and make 
their projects more sustainable. 
 
Dr Bob Klaber, director of strategy, research and 
innovation says “The Covid-19 pandemic hasn’t just 
affected our hospitals, it’s had wide ranging effects 
on our local communities as well, exacerbating 
health inequalities.  
 
We serve some of the poorest communities in 
London and, by offering support to groups who have 
a strong understanding of the needs of their 
community, we can help to address head-on some of 
the most pressing issues affecting people’s health in 
North West London, including food poverty, poor 
mental health and digital exclusion.”     More 
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   “ Care home staff have 
      been wonderful. ” 
 

Join us today and have your say! 
 

 

   

 

   

 

 

 

 

  “ My GP could offer more     
     support on referrals. ” 
 

Join us today and have your say! 
 

 

   

 

   

 

 

 

https://www.westlondon.nhs.uk/news/latest-news/celebrating-one-year-keeping-well-launched
https://www.imperial.nhs.uk/about-us/news/compassionate-communities-supports-local-health-projects-to-address-impacts-of-covid-19


 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 Diabetes Prevention Programme 
 
Humza Fazli, Engagement Officer for the North West 
London area writes: 
 
“I’ve been working at Xyla Health & Wellbeing for 
over 1 year, delivering the NHS Diabetes Prevention 
Programme alongside my engagement officer role 
and completing my MSc in Chronic Disease 
Management. I also have a strong interest in chronic 
disease and behaviour change based research. I’m 
due to publish my first journal article this year. 
 
Overview 
The NDPP stands for the NHS Diabetes Prevention 
Programme. The program is 9 months long and 
offers a mixture of 1-1 and group sessions focused 
on nutrition and physical activity. During each 
session, we provide you with the knowledge, skills 
and tools needed to make healthier lifestyle 
changes at each session.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
                 A focus on nutrition and physical activity 

 
We also support you to set goals which are specific 
to your own health with our team of trained health 
and wellbeing coaches. Over the course of the 
program, there are 13 sessions to attend. For the 
first 6 sessions these will be once a fortnight and 
then the following sessions take place once a 
month.  
 
We will cover a number of different topics over the 
course of the 9 months, such as portion sizes, 
understanding carbohydrates, the different types of 
physical activity, how we can change our habits, 
stress, mindful eating and even sleep. 
 
 

 

Spotlight 

 

 

Programme Accessibility 
It’s imperative that all our service users get 
adequate access to the NHS Diabetes Prevention 
Program.  
 
That’s why we’ve implemented measures that 
ensure access to individuals from all backgrounds 
and disability.  
 
This includes culturally appropriate food choices, 
considering religious festivities, mobility concerns 
and more. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
                  Supporting healthier lifestyle changes 

 
Referrals 
To find out if you may be at risk of developing Type 
2 Diabetes, you can complete the ‘know your risk’ 
tool online.    More 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Language Groups 
The NHS Diabetes Prevention Programme considers 
individuals from all backgrounds, which is why 
we’ve implemented other language-based group 
sessions.  
 
This means we deliver sessions in a number of 
different languages! Including Urdu, Punjabi, Hindi, 
Arabic, Farsi, Somali, Polish, Tamil, Cantonese, 
Spanish and more!” 
 
If you have any feedback, please feel free to 
contact the Patient Services team: 
 

  0333 577 3010 
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  “ Hospital letter arrived 
     late, again. ” 
 

Join us today and have your say! 
 

 

   

 

   

 

 

 

 

   “ Our dentist explained 
      all the costs. ” 
 

Join us today and have your say! 
 

 

   

 

   

 

 

 

https://preventing-diabetes.co.uk/Know-your-risk-dtc/


 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 The Hammersmith ‘Grow Well’ Scheme 
 
A fun project combining gardening, cooking and 
crafts is set to launch soon to help improve mental 
health and wellbeing for those most affected during 
the Covid-19 pandemic. 
 
The new ‘Grow Well’ scheme from local charity 
Hammersmith Community Gardens Association 
(HCGA) aims to bring together locals of all ages for 
‘flexible’ weekly volunteering sessions in 
Ravenscourt Park, says the charity’s operations 
manager Katie Shaw. 
 
“Since the start of the pandemic, we’ve had so 
many more requests for volunteering – especially 
more flexible volunteering,” explains Katie.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
                        Bringing local people together 

 
“People might have been furloughed, or made 
redundant, or have been in social isolation 
struggling with mental health and wellbeing.” 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
The Hammersmith Community Gardens Association, 
which is financially supported by Hammersmith & 
Fulham Council – was awarded £10,000 from 
Imperial Health Charity to run the year-long 
scheme, which kicks off on Saturday 15th June. 
 
Based at Ravenscourt Glasshouses in Ravenscourt 
Park, the project is due to run at 10am to noon and 
1pm to 3pm each Tuesday, for up to 10 volunteers 
at each session.  
 
Find more on the Council website.    More 
 

 

Community Noticeboard 

 

 

 Tech4Kids Appeal to Close the Digital Divide 
 
The Mayor of Hammersmith & Fulham, Cllr PJ 
Murphy, has named the community-led Tech4Kids 
appeal as one of his official charities to support this 
year. 
 
Local charity UNITED in Hammersmith & Fulham is 
raising funds for Tech4Kids, which runs in partnership 
with local tech social enterprise Ready Tech Go and 
Hammersmith & Fulham Council. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
              The scheme supports learning opportunities 

 
All the money raised will ensure that local children 
and young people in need get vital devices and data 
they require to catch up with their schoolwork. 
 
“The Covid crisis has really brought to the fore the 
importance of technology for some of our more 
disadvantaged people in the community,” Cllr Murphy 
said. 
 
“If pupils don’t have the devices from the start, 
they’ll lose out. So, it’s really important that 
everybody has access to technology. It would be 
fantastic if you could get involved and support us.” 
 
Tech4Kids aims to get 1,500 local children and young 
people laptops and internet connection.  
 
Many are living in poverty and have been identified 
through local head teachers as being most at risk of 
missing out on learning opportunities due to their life 
circumstances.    
 
Find more on the Council website.    More 
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   “ The phone is engaged 
      constantly! ” 
 

Join us today and have your say! 
 

   

 

   

 

 

 

 

  “ Food on the ward has 
     ticked my box! ” 
 

Join us today and have your say! 
 

   

 

   

 

 

 

https://www.lbhf.gov.uk/articles/news/2021/06/hammersmith-gardening-charity-looking-volunteers-hit-covid-layoffs
https://www.lbhf.gov.uk/articles/news/2021/06/hf-mayor-backs-tech4kids-appeal-close-digital-divide


 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
                                  

 

 

                                 

 

                              

 West London NHS Trust – @WestLondon magazines    More 
 
Please send us a link to your latest newsletter! 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  

 
  

 
 

 
 
 

 
 
 

                 Helping to keep ‘fit and independent’ 
 
The booklet is available on the website now.  More 
 
 

 The latest news and events from West London NHS Trust  More 
 The latest news from Imperial College Healthcare NHS Trust    More 
 The latest news from Hammersmith & Fulham CCG    More 
 The latest from the Recovery News Channel    More 
 NHS roll out of body cams in boost to ambulance crews safety    More 
 England’s top NHS nurse says volunteering surge can be positive COVID legacy    More 
 Government proposes mandating Covid-19 vaccination for care home workers    More 
 NHS treats first patient with the ‘world’s most expensive drug’    More 
 Social care cuts and increased charges causing ‘huge distress’ to disabled people    More 
 NHS vaccination programme jabs half of people in their 30s    More 
 Thousands of new recruits join the health service as NHS marks International Nurses Day    More 
 Dangers of children swallowing magnets prompts NHS call for ban    More 
 More demand, less supply and less personalisation, finds 5 year analysis of adult social care    More 
 NHS Chief Sir Simon Stevens joins 20 million double jabbed    More 
 More than a million children given access to NHS mental health support at school    More 
 Wide support for more comprehensive urgent care indicators    More 
 Adult social care referrals have spiked since end of 2020, says incoming ADASS president    More 
 Ambulance iPads improve patient care under NHS Long Term Plan    More 
 Government scraps coronavirus provisions allowing councils to suspend key Care Act duties    More 
 NHS sees record number of people in March, following urgent cancer referrals    More 
 What new domestic abuse legislation means for social workers    More 
 NHS to offer new drug that halves the risk of cancer returning    More 
 NHS’s £160 million ‘accelerator sites’ to tackle waiting lists    More 
 Dozens of unborn babies receive op on NHS to stop paralysis    More 
 Government ‘seriously considering’ allowing care homes to insist staff get Covid-19 vaccine    More 
 3D heart scans on the NHS to speed up disease diagnosis    More 
 NHS Chief Sir Simon Stevens to stand down this summer    More 
 

 

Resources 

 

 

 A Practical Guide to Healthy Ageing 
 
Introducing a booklet from Age UK and the NHS, 
aimed at helping improve the health and general 
fitness of people of any age, but written to be 
particularly relevant for people who are about 70 
years or older. 
 
People of this age, and sometimes younger, begin a 
‘slowing-down’ process related to the effects of 
ageing on their body. We cannot stop the process of 
ageing, but the advice given in the booklet can help 
to keep you fit and independent. 
 
 

 

Latest Newsletters 

 

 

 

News Summary 
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https://www.westlondon.nhs.uk/about-west-london-nhs-trust/news-and-media/westlondonnhsmagazine/
https://www.age-platform.eu/publications/practical-guide-healthy-ageing#:%7E:text=The%20Practical%20Guide%20to%20Healthy%20Ageing%2C%20ublished%20by,information%20on%20how%20to%20keep%20fit%20and%20independent.
https://www.westlondon.nhs.uk/news
https://www.imperial.nhs.uk/about-us/news
https://www.hammersmithfulhamccg.nhs.uk/newspublications/news.aspx
https://www.youtube.com/channel/UCfQ3c-7YTi4Twxabb0fWmlg?feature=emb_ch_name_ex
https://www.england.nhs.uk/2021/06/nhs-roll-out-of-body-cams-in-boost-to-ambulance-crews-safety/
https://www.england.nhs.uk/2021/05/volunteering-covid-legacy/
https://www.communitycare.co.uk/2021/04/14/government-proposes-mandating-covid-19-vaccination-care-home-workers/
https://www.england.nhs.uk/2021/06/nhs-treats-first-patient-with-the-worlds-most-expensive-drug/
https://www.communitycare.co.uk/2021/04/13/social-care-cuts-increased-charges-causing-huge-distress-disabled-people/
https://www.england.nhs.uk/2021/05/nhs-vaccination-programme-jabs-half-of-people-in-their-30s/
https://www.england.nhs.uk/2021/05/thousands-of-new-recruits-join-the-health-service-as-nhs-marks-international-nurses-day/
https://www.england.nhs.uk/2021/05/dangers-of-children-swallowing-magnets-prompts-nhs-call-for-ban/
https://www.communitycare.co.uk/2021/05/07/more-demand-less-supply-and-less-personalisation-finds-five-year-analysis-of-adult-social-care/
https://www.england.nhs.uk/2021/05/nhs-chief-sir-simon-stevens-joins-20-million-double-jabbed/
https://www.england.nhs.uk/2021/05/more-than-a-million-children-given-access-to-nhs-mental-health-support-at-school/
https://www.england.nhs.uk/2021/05/wide-support-for-more-comprehensive-urgent-care-indicators/
https://www.communitycare.co.uk/2021/04/29/adult-social-care-referrals-spiked-since-end-2020-says-incoming-adass-president/
https://www.england.nhs.uk/2021/05/ambulance-ipads-improve-patient-care-under-nhs-long-term-plan/
https://www.communitycare.co.uk/2021/03/25/government-scraps-coronavirus-provisions-allowing-councils-suspend-key-care-act-duties/
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https://www.england.nhs.uk/2021/05/dozens-of-unborn-babies-receive-op-on-nhs-to-stop-paralysis/
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https://www.england.nhs.uk/2021/05/3d-heart-scans-on-the-nhs-to-speed-up-disease-diagnosis/
https://www.england.nhs.uk/2021/04/nhs-chief-sir-simon-stevens-to-stand-down-this-summer/


Finding a dentist 
www.nhs.uk/dentists

What can your  
NHS dentist do for you?
The NHS provides essential treatments 
needed to keep your mouth, teeth 
and gums healthy and free of pain. 
Any treatment that is clinically 
necessary should be available. Here 
is some advice and details of the 
treatments and costs, giving you the 
knowledge to smile with confidence.

Your first routine visit    
•	 The dental practice will take your medical and dental history 

(if available) and carry out a check up; examining your mouth, 
teeth and gums.

•	 Following your check up if your dentist recommends dental 
treatment, you’ll be given a plan. This outlines all the treatments 
you are having and how much they will cost. If you are not given 
a treatment plan, ask for one.

•	 Your dentist will recommend a date for your next visit. People with good oral health 
may need to attend once every 12 to 24 months, but those with more problems may 
need to visit more often.

Visiting your dentist during  
the COVID-19 pandemic   
•	 Please only visit your practice if you have an appointment and 

book an appointment only if essential – dentists are currently 
prioritising the vulnerable or those with the most urgent need. 

•	 Appointments for some routine treatments, such as dental check-ups, may have to be 
rescheduled for a later date.

•	 Your practice will look a little different than usual as they will be operating in a way 
that observes COVID-19 social distancing and hygiene rules to ensure everyone’s safety. 

Emergency dental care 
•	Anyone who needs emergency dental care should first call their dental practice. 

•	If you cannot contact your dentist or do not have one, patients are advised to 
use the NHS 111 online service: www.111.nhs.uk

http://www.nhs.uk/dentists


You don’t have to pay for  
NHS dental treatments if you are:   

•	 under 18, or under 19 and in full-time education

•	 pregnant or have had a baby in the previous 12 months 

•	 being treated in an NHS hospital and your treatment is carried out by the hospital 
dentist (but you may have to pay for any dentures or bridges)

•	 receiving low income benefits, or you’re under 20 and a dependant of someone 
receiving low income benefits.

Payment    
You pay a contribution towards the cost of your care and are 
charged for treatments depending on which band they fall into. 
All NHS treatments are covered with a 12-month guarantee.

Find out more...
The NHS website has more information about dental services 
www.nhs.uk/using-the-nhs/nhs-services/dentists

Treatments   
•	Band 1 

(emergency treatment) covers emergency care,  
such as pain relief and temporary fillings.

•	Band 1 
covers an examination, diagnosis, a scale and polish if 
clinically needed, preventative care (such as fluoride varnish) 
and advice on how to prevent future problems.

•	Band 2 
covers everything listed in Band 1, plus any further treatment 
such as fillings, root canal work or removal of teeth.

•	Band 3 
covers everything listed in Bands 1 and 2, plus crowns, 
dentures, bridges and other laboratory work.

Band 1 
(including emergency treatment)
£ 23.80

Band 2 
£ 65.20

Band 3 
£ 282.80

Prices correct for 2020 / 21

http://www.nhs.uk/using-the-nhs/nhs-services/dentists

